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Abstract 

The human centered design (HCD) methodologies, that address problem by focusing on addressing human interaction 
with the existence of technology, have gained increased attention in light of the persistent challenge of low adoption 
rates in HR technology implementations.  This is a study that investigates how design thinking principles when applied 
in developing HR technology, dramatically influence user adoption and results in the organization. Building on 
Norman's (2013) fundamental research on user-centred design and designers thinking framework outlined by Brown 
(2008), we uncover that the impact of HCD driven HR solutions is that the adoption rates are increased by 30-40% 
compared to traditionally developed systems. In the development and strategic planning of HR platforms, these three 
factors—iterative user testing, empathy-based interface design, and continuous feedback mechanisms—are specifically 
adapted from our cases involving Workday and BambooHR. We have found that the companies using HCD principles 
during HRT tech development onboarding employees 2.3 times faster  and by 35% more interested these digital HRT 
tools.  It offers a validated framework for HCD implementation in HR technology projects in both academic and practical 
context and, in doing so, identifies organizational resistance to iterating towards an appropriate product and budget 
constraints for user research phases as primary barriers to adoption of HCD. These insights provide useful information 
to those in HR technology developing, occupational change managers, and digital transformation leaders who are trying 
to find out the best ways of adoption of technology within HRM systems. 

Keywords: Human-centered design; HR technology adoption; Design thinking; User experience; Organizational 
Change Management 

1. Introduction

Digital transformation in HR has made way to an era for workforce management technologies looking forward to make 
talent acquisition, employee development and organizational performance more optimal. Although these are the 
greatest technological capabilities ever, they have been barely explored since the barriers to adoption have proven to 
be so stubborn to overcome (Chakraborty & Mansor, 2013). Nearly half of all HR technology programs fail to use the 
capability in the predicted levels (Bersin, 2021). However, most of this disconnect is because the solutions that have 
been engineered are functional for technology but not usable for people, ultimately resulting in systems that remain 
largely abandoned or are used begrudgingly by employees (Smth. Et al., 2009). 

1.1. The Adoption Challenge in HR Technology 

There are several measurable was in which the crisis of adoption of HR technology manifests. However, the complex 
system architectures cause cognitive overload for end­ users, especially for those who are non­ technical, of which the 
majority of HR system users represent (Norman, 2013). According to Deloitte (2013), workforce technology survey, 
almost 70 percent of employees never or rarely take part in their organization’s HR self service platforms despite 
substantial corporate spending on those solutions. The same disengagement pattern occurs across other HR technology 
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uses, as well as learning management system completion rates are low and performance management tools (when 
utilized) are often viewed as bureaucratic hurdles rather than as value adding resources (Gasson, 2003). 

1.2. Theoretical Foundations of Human-Centered Design 

Human Centered Design turns out to be a pioneering approach to work around these adoption barriers. HCD is grounded 
on the early work of Norman on user centered system (Norman, 2013), and Brown’s design thinking model (Brown, 
2008), and is driven by the need to change a paradigm from technology driven development to human driven 
development. This methodology outlines the steps to prioritize customer needs systemically through three core phases: 
empathetic research, which uncovers the contexts and pain points of end users; iterative prototyping, which tests 
possible answers to problems; and ongoing refinement on insights from reality (Carroll & Wagar, 2010). The approach 
acknowledges that technical functionality of a technology and psychological and behavioral factors are equally 
important determinants of a successful technology adoption. 

 
Source: Future Processing 

Figure 1 The three pillars of human-centered design in HR technology development 

1.3. Documented Impact of HCD on HR Systems 

Empirical evidence shows the real value of using HCD principles in HR technology. Implementing of HCD methodologies 
by organizations has led to adoption rates 40% more i.e. than industry average and 30% decrease in On boarding time 
(PwC, 2014). There are several important factors that helped deliver these improvements: the interfaces are designed 
based on actual employee workflows, not idealized processes; the systems are tolerant of relatively lower levels of 
technical literacy in the users; and the solutions show immediate value to end users. Additionally, HCD created systems 
are known to present much higher long term engagement with user satisfaction metrics since they typically beat 
traditional HR tech systems by a large margin (McKinsey, 2021). 

1.4. Research Objectives and Scope 

Similar to other pieces of technology being integrated into practices, the objective of this study is to examine, how the 
HCD methodologies and HR technology adoption intersect via three key research questions. First, it identifies how 
specific HCD practices impact usability metrics as well as engagement patterns of enterprise HR systems (Smith et al., 
2009). Second, it reveals the critical success factors of the difference between effective applications of the HCD and its 
superficial use (Carroll & Wagar, 2010). Third, it reviews the organizational barriers that frequently defeat HCD 
initiatives in HR technology projects (Chakraborty & Mansor, 2013). Four categories of enterprise HR technology 
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systems are researched: talent acquisition, performance management, employee self service and learning development 
systems. 

1.5. Academic and Practical Significance 

The implications of this research are multiple domain. It contributes to a growing pool of knowledge at the boundary of 
organizational psychology, technology adoption theory and design science for academic researchers. As an evidence 
based framework for HR practitioners and technology developers to create systems employees will use and value, it 
enables HR professionals to better understand employees needs and desires and help technology developers recognize 
how their products can make a difference. Given that global HR technology expenditures are expected to reach $38 
billion by 2027 (Gartner, 2018), the results provide key direction for maximizing the return on the massive spend. 
Finally, the study addresses a gap by supplying quantitative benchmarks on the effectiveness of HCD in HR technology 
contexts  (Gasson, 2003). 

1.6. Article Structure 

In subsequent sections of this article, HCD in HR technology is examined as a whole. The review of literature brings 
together the research conducted in design science and HR technology adoption areas (Smith et al., 2009). The section 
on methodology elaborates the mixed methods research approach, specifically, case study analysis, user survey, and 
expert interview (Carroll & Wagar, 2010). At the conclusion, the findings section provides comparative adoption metrics 
of HCD developed HR systems against conventional HR Systems. The results of this study are then translated into the 
form of practical implementation frameworks in the discussion and the conclusion states future research directions in 
this burgeoning field. This structure of the article presents theoretical insights and practical tactics for improving HR 
technology adoption by applying human centered approach. 

A successful introduction of the critical importance of solving HR technology adoption challenges with proven design 
methodologies. The rest of the sections will use a foundation of this as the basis to discuss in greater detail, with evidence 
and analysis, the central thesis that human centered design is the most promising way to achieve the maximum potential 
from HR technologies. 

2. Literature Review  

There is a strong link between design principles and organizational behavior theories to the successful adoption of HR 
technology. This section stitches together existing scholarship on three key areas: the theoretical foundations of human 
centered design, existing HR technology adoption challenges, and the empirics indicating what design methodologies 
lead to implementation success. We use these intersecting areas to form a comprehensive framework, within which, 
HCD principles can be applied to eliminate some of these challenges. 

2.1. Theoretical Underpinnings of Human-Centered Design 

Philosophically, Human-Centered Design draws from Norman (2013), in his seminal work on user centred systems, 
where one assumes that effective design is based upon a clear understanding of end-user needs and limitations as well 
as environmental contexts of use. From this perspective, usability has been and continues to be challenged as a mere 
feature that can be added during technology development, but is a primary design requirement. Brown (2008) design 
thinking methodology was further developed as the theoretical background, and they provided structured processes 
for translating user insights into tangible solutions. These foundations are built upon to implement HCD in enterprise 
settings nowadays in three operational principles. In order to be empathetically engaged, the designer must first move 
away from assumptions and actually observe user behaviors and pain points, which then informs and allows her to 
empathize better before designing. Second, iterative prototyping focuses primarily on rapid development of low fidelity 
models for early user testing and then iteration until the final version which was sure to be developed with the early 
low fidelity models is decided upon. Third, systems thinking allows addressing complete user journeys, meaning 
solution should solve the entire interactions between all aspects of organizational ecosystems and not isolated one 
(Deloitte, 2020). The theoretical constructs in this paper constitute the conceptual scaffolding for consideration of the 
role of HCD in HR technology implementation. 

2.2. Documented Barriers to HR Technology Adoption 

According to academic research and industry reports consistently, there are several systemic challenges when trying to 
implement HR technology successfully (Norman, 2013). A longitudinal study conducted by Deloitte (2014) found that 
more than 60 percent of HR technology project don’t reach the targets for adoption and they are abandoned mostly by 
legacy organizations in the process of digital transformation. Despite massive technical capabilities being developed, 
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this pattern continues on this basis: obstacles are not primarily technical, but human. Three categories of most common 
adoption barriers are cited. The cognitive overload caused by interface complexity is worst for the occasional users; 
these are the users who may use HR systems only occasionally, but for the critical functions. Workflow misalignments 
are systems whose processes are imposed and are in conflict with the people and their preferences and practice (Gasson, 
2003). Change resistance bubbles over when implementations are considered top down mandates and not workable 
solutions of real user needs. This implies that HR technology development should be regarded as an organizational 
change initiative, rather than a technical change. 

2.3. Empirical Evidence for HCD in HR Technology 

Recent case studes suggest that HCD approach are effective in HR technology context. The 2021 platform redesign by 
Workday (2021), which took a large amount of user research and iteration testing into account, resulted in 45% more 
daily active users than past versions. For instance, similar to BambooHR’s user centric interface design approach,they 
have scored continuously high in customer satisfaction as 89% of the users state that it is easy to use (HR Tech Weekly, 
2018). Quantitative analysis of the HCD implementation patterns is consistent across implementations. “The systems of 
which the development has involved a substantial user, have reached 30-40% higher adoption rates after one year of 
implementation compared to systems that were developed following traditional development approaches”. 
Longitudinal data is available for these advantages over time as HCD developed systems continue to have higher 
participant engagement even as organizational needs change. These outcomes seem to be facilitated by perceived higher 
usefulness of the systems, lower training needs for users and stronger emotional connection between users and 
systems. 

2.4. Synthesis of Key Research Gaps 

Although existing literature gives strong indication to the existence of correlation between HCD practices and the 
success of HR technology, there are a few critical questions that remain unraveled. Open questions remain regarding 
sustained use that most studies take a view on how users adopt initial items instead of sustainable usage patterns. The 
relative importance of different HCD components, for example how important is the depth of user research, vs. how 
many rounds of testing, etc. has not been studied systematically. There is also little research on how organizational 
culture moderates the effectiveness of HCD when the organizational values are highly hierarchical or resistant to 
change. 

The literature review shows that the theoretical case for HCD in HR technology is well established while there are still 
areas for further investigation on implementation methodology and contextual factors. In the next section, our 
methodology to fill these gaps through in depth case analysis and empirical research are explained. This study is 
intended to both answer the open questions and build upon the existing scholarly work to aid in the development of the 
human centered design in HR technology context. 

This review indicates that challenges of HR technology adoption are predominantly human problems with solutions 
that are human. The following sections will look into how organizations can put these insights to work with HCD 
structured methodologies, while also broaching the organizational and technical detours an organization must go 
through to reap successful implementations. 

3. Research Methodology 

A mixed methods approach was used to fully explore the impact that human-centered design (HCD) has on the adoption 
of HR technology (Yin, 2008). The methodology integrates qualitative and quantitative approaches ensuring depth and 
breadth of analysis and triangulation of findings from data gathered from multiple data sources. To fill the gaps pointed 
out in the literature review and also to make the research framework practical applicable to HR professionals as well as 
to technology designers, the research framework was developed. 

3.1. Research Design and Approach 

The study employs an explanatory sequential Mixed Methods design, where it first conducts quantitative analysis of the 
adoption metrics of a number of HR platforms and then qualitatively explores the underlying reasons of those outcomes 
(Venkatesh et al., 2003). This aligns with (Creswell, 2014) recommendations for the studies aiming at first 
understanding the existence of the patterns and then with identifying what cause those patterns. The quantitative phase 
enables measurability of the relationships between HCD practices and adoption rates, whereas the qualitative phase 
includes contextual understanding of implementing and perceiving these practices in organizational settings (Rogers, 
2003). 
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3.2. Data Collection Methods 

To ensure broad coverage of the research questions, the research includes three major strategies of data collection. The 
investigation is built on six case study analyses on the implementations of HR technology in various industries (Yin, 
2009). These cases vary in terms of organizational size, technology types and implementations, and through purposive 
sampling, were chosen to represent such differences. Multiple sources of data, such as the number of system usage 
statistics, user satisfaction surveys, and documentation of the implementation are used for each case study. Thirty two 
key stakeholders, from HR technology designers, implementation consultants to end user perspectives, were 
interviewed using semi structured interviews (Patton, 2008). The design of the interview protocol was aimed at 
obtaining richly detailed stories of the design process, implementation issues and user experiences. Recruitment of 
participants was geared through professional networks and industry associations in order to ensure representation in 
various organizational contexts  (Likert, 1932). In order to use a standardized metric for technology adoption and 
perceived usability, quantitative surveys were distributed among 215 HR professionals in different industries. To gather 
data, an instrument consisting of validated technology acceptance research scales and custom instrument items specific 
to HCD practices was employed. With a response rate of 68%, the dataset is rich enough for statistical analysis. 

3.3. Analytical Framework 

The research employs a multi level analytical approach to study contingent systematic phenomena both on a micro 
(user experiences) and on a macro (organizational) level (Field, 2009). Descriptive and inferential statistics are used to 
analyze quantitative data, especially regarding the comparison of HCD-developed and conventionally developed 
systems' adoption metrics between HCD-developed and conventionally developed systems. Regression analysis is used 
to study the measure of the relationship between certain HCD practices and the outcome of adoption while holding fixed 
organizational variables. Thematic analysis is conducted using Braun and Clarke (2006) six-phase framework on the 
qualitative data. The data is coded using deductive codes obtained from the literature review, and inductive codes from 
the data. NVivo software facilitates systematic coding and pattern identification across the qualitative dataset. In the 
analysis of the case study, logical control follows the replication logic prescribed by Yin (2018) and compare case 
findings across cases to establish common patters and variations of context. 

3.4. Validity and Reliability Considerations 

Several safeguards are included in the research to provide methodological rigor. It does so via convergence of evidence 
from interview and survey questionnaires and also from case studies. Validity is enhanced through member checking, 
whereby preliminary findings are shared with selected participants to determine whether they agree with your 
interpretations. Cronbach's alpha scores of all multi item scales are well over 0.85, thus showing a strong reliability of 
the quantitative measures. Systematic documentation of potential level of biases and preconceptions is used to maintain 
researcher reflexivity (Miles & Huberman, 1994). The research team is composed of both HR technology specialists and 
design researchers creating a balanced point of view during data analysis (Eisenhardt, 1989). All participant data are 
strictly confidential and the study design includes ethical considerations as covered by the institutional review board 
approval. 

3.5. Limitations and Boundary Conditions 

Although the methodology is robust to examining the research questions, there are also some limitations of which we 
need to be aware. The case study approach, while rich in depth, limits broad generalizability of findings. In skewing 
towards med and large organizations, small business use case is potentially underrepresented. The main base of the 
research is US implementations; however, cultural variations having effects on HCD effectiveness are left open. The 
second limitation is related to the temporal factors, since adoption patterns are extracted at certain time snapshots and 
thus do not cover a complete technology lifecycle. Moreover, self-reported data is used for some metrics resulting in 
response biases. However, these limitations are mitigated by the mixed methods design and use of triangulation of data 
sources, but must be considered for interpretation of the finding. 

3.6. Operationalization of Key Constructs 

The study fixes its own core concepts in measurable indicators. These are assessed by five dimensions the depth of user 
research, the frequency of the prototyping iterations, the amount of user testing, composition of the design team, and 
how much of the budget should be allocated for UX activities (Likert, 1998). There are three primary metrics that we 
evaluate the success of a given adoption: system utilization rates, user satisfaction scores, time-to-competency 
benchmarks (Yin, 2009). Organizational size, industry sector, technology type, and length of implementation make up 
the control variables. They enable all the nuances related to how different HCD practices play out in different contexts 
to inform adoption outcomes. Results of this complete methodological methodology are presented in the following 
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findings section, first through patterns that are quantitative and, second, with qualitative insights regarding the 
mechanisms underlying these outcomes. This rigorous methodology constitutes the basis on which evidence based 
conclusions can be made about HCD's role in adoption of HR technology (Miles & Huberman, 1984). By combining 
statistical analysis with rich qualitative data, measurable outcomes exist that are also practical insights for organizations 
wanting to improve the HR technology implementation. This investigation will be followed by the subsequent findings 
section in which results will be presented depending on an order of relevance according to the key research questions 
guiding this study. 

4. Results and Discussion 

In this section we present the empirical results pertaining to the impact of HCD in driving HR tech adoption ordered by 
our three primary research questions. These findings come forth from a systematic analysis of the relationships, as 
inferred from our mixed methods dataset, between design practices and adoption outcomes in a consistent form and, 
sometimes, with important variations. 

4.1. Usability and Engagement Metrics Affected by HCD 

Quantitative data reveals significant difference in the metrics of adoption of HCD developed and conventional HR 
systems (Nielsen, 1993). The applications that were developed using HCD methodologies achieved 42 % higher average 
daily usage rate (t=5.67, p<0.001) and 35 % lower abandonment rate within the first 6 months from the implementation 
(χ²=28.4, p<0.001). There also exist differences between technology types, which have strong effects on learning 
management systems and performance management platforms. Advantage of HCD implementations is even more 
pronounced in user satisfaction scores (Shneiderman, 1998). The HCD systems on average perceived with higher 
usability than the conventional systems (M=8.2, SD=1.1 vs. M=6.1, SD=1.8; F=47.2, p<0.001). There was qualitative data 
that implied that these differences are the result of three interesting HCD characteristics, which are: intuitive navigation 
structures that align to mental models; contextual help where they’re located where they’re needed; and personalized 
dashboards that surface what users want to see. 

These patterns are furnished compelling examples in the case studies. With the HCD-redesigned employee portal, we 
saw 92% active monthly usage 3 months after the deployment trying to not revolutionize the company, as opposed to 
the prior system currently at 58%. It turned out that 'this success can be attributed mainly to the decision to involve 
front line managers in 12 co design sessions' (VP of HR) 'to ensure that the interface addressed real workflow needs as 
opposed to IT preferences (Krug, 2006). 

Table 1 Comparative Adoption Metrics (HCD vs. Traditional Design) 

Metric HCD-Developed Systems Traditional Systems Improvement (%) 

Average Daily usage 785 55% +42% 

6-month abandonment 15% 23% -35% 

User satisfaction (1-10) 8.2 6.1 +34% 

Time-to-competency 3.2 weeks 5.1 weeks -37% 

Figure 2 below illustrates how human centered design (HCD) leverages impacts usage rates of HR technology; instances 
where they prove better adopted compared to traditionally developed systems. Such a visualization grounds all of our 
empirical findings which show that 85% of HCD implementations achieve adoption, or a 70% increase over the adoption 
rate of traditional systems (50%). These metrics support the usability benefits described in Sections 2.1 and 3.2, and 
are actionable validation of them for stakeholders making investment decisions. 
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Source: Internet Researcher 

Figure 2 Impact of Human-Centered Design on HR Technology Adoption 

4.2. Critical Success Factors in HCD Implementation 

We found four factors that differentiate good implementations of HCD from superficial ones. First, for adoption success, 
authentic user involvement throughout the design process, not just during requirements gathering or just at the end of 
the design process became the strongest predictor. For instance, sprints where end-users actively engaged in weekly 
sprints over out-of-band feedback sessions had 28% more user engagement (β=0.47, p=0.003) (Cooper et al., 2007). 
Second, iterative prototyping cadence, although did not cause outcomes, did affect the outcomes. Faster competency 
achieved (M=3.2 weeks faster for bi weekly teams (t=3.89, p=0.001) vs. a M=5.1 weeks later for monthly teams. This 
was vividly demonstrated in a healthcare case study, where it turned out nurses only needed one click to have access to 
scheduling functions—something that was added in version 3 of the prototype, which then become the most used 
element of the system. Third, end-users, UX specialists, and HR practitioners brought together in cross functional design 
teams, outperformed the siloed approach. These teams are able to produce 40% fewer support tickets in the first year 
(Quantitative analysis: F=32.1, p<0.001), and both reports and follow on interviews support their effectiveness. 
Interview data identifies how this collaboration brings forth 'hidden knowledge' such as when an insurance company 
uncovered during joint sessions that claims processors require dual monitor optimization when none had been 
specified in the original requirements (Nonaka & Takeuchi, 1995). Fourth, it is essential that there is leadership 
commitment to HCD processes. 2.3× ROI within 18 months derives from organizations that devoted >15% of project 
budgets to user research and testing, as opposed to 1.4× ROI established by conventional approaches. CEO mandated 
“design immersion days” for executives at a manufacturer led to a sustained human resources app on the shop floor that 
was 85% voluntarily adopted by hourly workers through the funding of iterative testing. 

Table 2 HCD Implementation Success Factors 

Success Factor Implementation Example Observed Outcome 

Continous User Involvement Weekly co-design sessions 28% more usability issues caught early 

Bi-weekly Prototyping Functional prototypes tested every 2 weeks 37% faster competency 

Cross-functional teams HR + IT + End-users +UX designers 40% fewer post-launch support tickets 

Leadership commitment 15% budget for user research 2.3x ROI within 

4.3. Persistent Barriers and Mitigation Strategies 

But even though a number of these were successful, we did learn about three significant implementation challenges. 
However 68% of the time, the organization resisted iterative development and stakeholders wanted polished solutions 
prior to achieving the levels of learning necessary to meet those requirements (Kotter, 1996). This was overcome by a 
professional services firm with "progress prototyping", prototyping incrementally until the next step of improvement 
was demonstrated in a measurable way. 55% of implementations were constrained by budgetary restrictions for user 
research, preventing HCD from being carried out to a sufficient degree. Nevertheless, some groups found ways of 
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offering low cost alternatives such as 'guerilla testing' (conducting quick hallway usability tests) and reaching out to 
people within the organization and utilizing internal social platforms for feedback (Virzi, 1992). Formal testing benefits 
are shown here at 30% of the cost and delivering 72% of the benefits. For the most complex barrier I encountered was 
measuring HCD’s impact pre-launch. It was this exact thing that forward looking organizations tackled by applying 
“adoption forecasting”, which was to marry prototype testing metrics with historical data to predict how much users 
would use their product in the real world. A single tech company's model was able to output final adoption rates within 
±5% as early as prototype version 4 (Tullis & Albert, 2008). 

4.4. Population Growth and Resource Consumption 

As the global population grows, demand for basic and scarce resources such as food, water, energy resources and raw 
materials, continues to rise. As such, the relationship between population growth and its corresponding resources 
consumption is a very important matter to understand in environmental sustainability and economic development. 
There are historical data regarding human consumption of natural resources, which have skyrocketed along with a 2.5 
to 7.8 billion surge in the human population, during the time span from 1950 to 2020.nThe following graph shows that 
correlation between this global population growth and an increasing resource consumption index (Virzi, 1992). 
Advancements in technology have increased the efficiency, while rampant demand for these resources threatens 
depletion of the earth, degradation of the environment, as well as global warming. Currently, one of the biggest 
challenges in the coming decades will be to balance population needs with sustainable resource management if the 
current trends nudge. 

 
Source: Interenet Researcher 

Figure 3 Population Growth vs. Resources Consumption over time 

4.5. Theoretical and Practical Implications 

This paper significantly extends the literature in 3 ways. In the first place, they quantify how big the effect of HCD was 
on HR technology adoption. Second, they measure the specific mechanisms by which HCD generates value, with a focus 
on liquid rather than solid user engagement. Third, they indicate contextual factors that moderate the effectiveness of 
HCD, and thus help explain why similar methodologies achieved very different outcomes in the field (Smith et al., 2008). 
The suggestions are actionable, and are relevant for practitioners. First, we find that the 15% budget threshold for user 
research is a strong dividing line, and the bi-weekly testing cadence makes for a good implementation target. This 
supports restructuring HR tech development approach as cross functional design teams perform very well. Most 
importantly, the findings point out that HCD does not have to be unduly expensive if organizations use innovative, scaled 
back forms of the core methodologies. 

4.6. Limitations and Future Research Directions 

Although this research offers strong evidence of HCD's worth, some limitations offer promising directions for future 
research. Questions regarding cultural variations in HCD effectiveness are left open by the predominance of US based 
cases. Because medium and large enterprises are the focus, complementary work in small business contexts is needed. 



International Journal of Science and Research Archive, 2021, 04(01), 329-339 

337 

Since longitudinal tracking of sustained adoption patterns beyond 24 months will be able to show up whether HCD's 
advantages are better over time or if it progressively decreases (Kotter, 1996). Research into HCD’s role as part of AI 
driven HR tools is particularly promising since many of our data collection has occurred prior to widespread use of 
generative AI. Furthermore, looking into the use of scalable HCD methods with a distributed workforce could have 
helped with one of the key challenges that we heard in our interviews. This would further enhance evidence based for 
human centered approaches of designing and implementation of HR technology (Nielsen, 1993). 

Very strong support for the central thesis that HCD methodologies significantly improve HR technology adoption was 
provided by the consistency of the findings across both methodologies and cases. In the following conclusion section, 
this research is translated into a set of practical recommendations for HR leaders, technology designers, and 
organizational change practitioners who are attempting to close the still unbounded space between the promised 
capabilities of HR technology and the actual resistance to the adoption of these seemingly natural technologies. 

5. Conclusion 

This research verifies that Human-Centered Design (HCD) establishes itself as an essential technology for increasing HR 
system adoption through systematic assessment of user needs and behavior for practical implementation. The research 
data demonstrates HCD systems generate superior adoption performance than standard HR platforms concerning user 
satisfaction and system utilization and skill acquisition efficiency. HR technology development benefits from integrating 
design thinking principles because of its demonstrated added value for systems. The research confirms that placing 
human needs at the forefront of creation is crucial to achieve digital transformation success within human resource 
management practices. 

6. Recommendation  

These proposed recommendations aim to assist organizations in effective Human-Centered Design (HCD) 
implementation for better adoption and usability of HR technologies based on research outcomes. These guidelines are 
intended to boost technical outcomes of these systems along with producing positive user experiences and maintaining 
digital solutions within HR domains. 

6.1. Creating continuous user involvement becomes an essential design principle in every development project 

The entire development process of HR technology requires sustained active involvement of end-users from inception 
to completion. Organizations need to move past single-event user surveys and focus groups when implementing a 
combination of weekly design co-creation meetings and user advisory groups with design team embedded 
representatives. Through a persistent dialog between designers and beneficiaries the solution has the potential to show 
actual operations and anticipate staff expectations accurately. 

6.2. Organizations should develop iterative and inclusive prototyping practices for their systems development. 

Revolving around speed is better than following standard waterfall development methods. Early system evaluation will 
occur through the testing of functional low-fidelity models that helps designers address design flaws as soon as possible. 
A diverse group of users including people from various roles and digital literacies and departments should participate 
in testing the system to make it accessible for all users. The interface improves through continuous refinement because 
feedback allows for the creation of more accepted solutions. 

6.3. The project needs to allocate funds specifically for user research together with testing activities 

The main financial obstacles prevent organizations from executing HCD approaches. According to the study data the 
investment of 15–20% from project costs in user research along with usability testing and user interface creation results 
in solid project ROI. Organizations with minimal budgets can still obtain helpful insights through three cost-effective 
methods which include guerilla testing and internal user panels and informal feedback loops. 

6.4. Create Cross-Functional Design Teams 

Implementing HCD successfully needs teams composed of experts from different sectors to collaborate together. The 
system design requires personnel from HR and IT with UX specialists and front users to collaborate equally throughout 
the development process. By integrating various aspects all elements including technical capabilities, user satisfaction 
and system operations remain under consideration. Organizations that use cross-functional teams succeed in detecting 
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undisclosed requirements and eliminate partitioned strategies while developing systems that mimic true conditions of 
application 

6.5. The organization needs to utilize leading adoption metrics which will generate early feedback systems. 

The assessment of adoption needs to start during the design phase through the implementation of predictive indicators. 
Measures of prototype work completion times combined with user ratings of usefulness and model satisfaction ratings 
enable organizations to foresee upcoming adoption obstacles. Design teams increase successful rollouts probability 
through continuous monitoring of these indicators. 

6.6.  Idea supporters at executive levels and strategic sponsors need to form alliances to ensure project success. 

The commitment from leadership toward HCD requires more than authorization because leaders should actively 
participate in the process. Executive team members need to participate in design review meetings and participate 
during user testing observations while promoting user-oriented initiatives across organizational divisions. Through 
their advocacy employees demonstrate both the significance of experience improvement at work and promote overall 
organizational acceptance. HCD programs need leadership backing to successfully obtain financial support and direct 
technical projects toward fundamental strategic HR targets. 

6.7. Organizations should formalize Human-Centered Design practices for use throughout development 
projects of their human resource technologies. 

Sustaining the advantages of HCD demands that it becomes a permanent practice instead of remaining a singular event. 
Organizations must establish fully developed HCD procedures by creating employee guidelines and IT and HR education 
initiatives and collecting documentation about successful practices. The establishment of institutional knowledge will 
allow HCD capabilities to expand and embed user-focused culture and experimental and empathetic approaches across 
the entire HR operations system. 

These organizational guidelines enable companies to develop digital HR systems which their employees genuinely 
accept. Thorough human-centered implementation enhances technology investments' value and produces an agile HR 
department and user-friendly HR services. 
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